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Topic: General Phase: All schools

Many schools in Buckinghamshire have begun to implement
the new statutory Relationships/RSE and Health Education
curriculum, reviewed their  PSHE provision and have
consulted on their Relationships/RSE policy. The updated
guidance recognises that not all schools will have completed
full preparations for implementing the required changes by
September 2020. It is important to continue to implement the
curriculum wherever possible and I am sure you will agree,
PSHE including Relationships/RSE and Health Education
provides a vital framework for teaching pupils about looking
after their own wellbeing, adapting to change, building safe
and positive relationships and managing the opportunities
and challenges of daily life. With the transition back to school
now  taking place, high quality PSHE will be integral to
supporting all pupils  to process the impact Covid-19 has had
on our lives and to enable schools to provide a planned and
structured approach to teaching pupils the skills , attributes
and strategies they need to manage all aspects of their
emotional, physical, personal and social development.

The outcomes for Relationships/ RSE and Health Education
and supporting DfE materials are all available to view on the
links contained in the attached document below. 

Should you require further support please contact Carol
Stottor  Public Health lead for PSHE  
Carol.Stottor@buckinghamshire.gov.uk
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